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TN0330100

3800 Chandler Ave18-050319 6/7/2018   3:00:00PM 91Z All Other Traffic Offenses

On 06/07/2018 at 15:00 hours, Officer Thomas (71989) responded to a All Other Traffic Offenses at 3800 Chandler Ave. 
Defendant was stopped at 3800 Chandler Ave. for improper display of registration (high in rear window, unreadable). Upon further 
investigation defendant had no insurance, and a suspended DL.

4100 Central Ave18-050639 6/7/2018   3:00:00PM 91Z All Other Traffic Offenses

On 06/07/2018 at 15:00 hours, Officer Thomas (71989) responded to a All Other Traffic Offenses at 4100 Central Ave. Defendant 
was stopped for registration that did not match the vehicle (displayed on a Pontiac, came back to a Hyundai) .Upon further 
investigation, defendant had no insurance, and a suspended DL .

101 E 20th St18-050714 6/3/2018  12:25:00AM 240 MVT/Passenger Vehicle

This case was reviewed and will not have any suspect leads at this time; the victim was contacted but could not be reached and 
did not have any messaging system set up. Based on the lack of leads the case will be suspended, if any leads are later 
developed the case will then be assigned to an investigator for follow up.

1506 Bailey Ave18-050716 6/3/2018  12:10:00AM 91Z Field Interview

On 06/03/2018 at 00:10 hours, Officer Adam Krystaponis (75508) observed a white Ford CVP sedan with dark window tint driving 
through the 1700 Block of Bailey Ave displaying an expired license plate.  Upon stopping the vehicle in front of 1561  Bailey Ave, I 
made contact with the driver, a Mr. Joshua Madden.  Mr. Madden informed me that he was trying to get his car through 
emissions in order to update the registration, and he had just gotten pulled over 2 days earlier.  I asked the occupants of the 
vehicle if there were any illegal substances or weapons int he vehicle, and the front passenger, Mr. Isaiah Simmons, stated he ha 
d a firearm in his back that he was transporting in the car.  Mr. Simmons stated he had just received the pistol from his uncle.  I 
asked the occupants of the vehicle for permission to search the vehicle, and Mr. Madden consented.  No illegal substances or 
weapons were located in the vehicle.  Since Mr. Madden had a valid driver's license, Mr. Simmons was not a prohibited 
possessor, and none of the occupants (including Mr. Darius Benford, back passenger) had any valid warrants, Mr. Madden was 
given a verbal warning for his registration and sent on his way.  No further.

1200 E 3rd St18-050726 6/3/2018  12:11:00AM 91Z All Other Traffic Offenses

On 06/03/2018 at 13:52 hours, Officer Seech (79539) wrote a continuation/supplement for a All Other Traffic Offenses at 1200 E 
3rd St. The Ecstasy pill was turned into CPD Property at 0212 on this date under property #18-2427.

1152 Lenny Ln18-050728 6/3/2018  12:30:00AM 91Z Miscellaneous Information



6/3/2018  12:00:51AM TO 6/9/2018  11:59:51PM

On 06/03/2018 at 00:45 hours, Officer T. Perocchi (79535) responded to activity at 1152 Lenny Lane.  Police spoke with 
Lashunda Williams, who stated she heard two load thuds from the back of her home.  Police checked the area around her home 
and drove the length of her street and there was nothing found.

 

2700 Hixson Pike18-050747 6/3/2018   2:35:00AM 91Z Field Interview

On 06/03/2018 at 02:35 hours, Officer Josiah Blakney (78365) observed a party walking through the S curves at 2700 Hixson 
Pike.  When I stopped to talk to him, he identified himself as Kenneth Adams.  Kenneth stated that he was currently using the 
Community Kitchen, 727 E 11th St, as his address.  I checked him for warrants and transported him to the walking bridge.  No 
further.

 

2479 Bridge Cir18-050798 6/3/2018   7:52:00AM 91Z Miscellaneous Information

On 06/03/2018 at 08:00 hours, Officer Parda #1101  (78387) reported a memo at 2479 Bridge Cir. 
Police were dispatched to location as someone had reported 2 parties looking into vehicles.
Upon arrival at scene I spoke with Dixie Graham and Isaiah Warren who car was broken down.  The vehicle was located on 
private property, so we could initiate a tow.  Mr. Warren was going to make arrangements to have vehicle towed to his residence 
so he could make repairs.  Both parties were ran in Watson to verify identity.
Ms. Graham was wearing a dark colored tank top, with her hair pulled to the back, light colored blue jeans with a tear on the left 
knee and dark colored sandals.
Mr. Warren was wearing black shoes, dark colored t-shirt with white pattern on the front, as well as a black hat with an emblem 
on the front.  Mr. Warren also had a spider tattoo located under his left eye.  
No further information at this time.

727 E 11th St18-050808 6/3/2018   7:40:00AM 91Z Miscellaneous Information

On 06/03/2018 at 09:19 hours, Officer Mitchell Moss (0060171) reported a memo at 727 E 11th St.  Upon arrival Ms. Scott 
wanted to make a report about someone taking her white belt and leaving another white belt for her, while she was in the shower.  
There were no witnesses and no video.  There was also no evidence to show that it was intentional and not a mistake.

1 Cherokee Blvd18-050812 6/3/2018   9:25:00AM 26B Credit Card/ATM Fraud



6/3/2018  12:00:51AM TO 6/9/2018  11:59:51PM

On 06/03/2018 at 09:22 hours, Officer Glenn, Clifton (60757) responded to a Credit Card/ATM Fraud at 1 Cherokee Blvd.   I 
spoke with Samantha Skipper by telephone.  She says that on 31  May, 2018, an unknown party used her SunTrust debit card 
information to withdraw $500.00 from her checking account.  She says there was also a $3.00 transaction fee.  She says then the 
unknown attempted to withdraw $1,000.00 but the transaction was denied and the card placed on hold. She says that her card 
information had to be copied at an undetermined location.  She says that it will take 10 days for SunTrust Bank to process and 
return her money to her account.

501 Signal Mountain Rd18-050828 6/3/2018  10:10:00AM 91Z Field Interview

On 06/03/2018 at 10:10 hours, Officer K. Otto (63031) observed two suspicious parties enter the Walmart at 501  Signal Mountain 
Rd.   When making contact with the parties inside the store, they were identified as Mr. Christopher King and Ms. Kimberly 
Tawzer.  Both parties stated that they were homeless and had come to the store on their bikes to get a few items.  Both parties 
were wearing book bags and due to previous encounters I believed the parties had been banned from the store for shoplifting.  I 
was able to contact the Loss Prevention Officer on duty, Gabe Layne, who then checked the Walmart Loss Prevention records.  
Mr. Layne stated that they had been confronted outside the store for panhandling in the past but were never banned from the 
store.  Both parties were checked and no local warrants were found.  Both were then released and no further action taken.

7600 Meadow Stream Loop18-050841 6/3/2018  12:01:00AM 91Z Miscellaneous Information

On 06/03/2018 at 10:55 hours, Officer Glenn, Clifton (60757) reported a memo at 7600 Meadow Stream Loop.  I spoke with April 
Jackson by telephone.  She says that sometime during the night, an unknown party entered her unlocked 2005 Chevrolet 
Uplander.  She says the unknown went through the glove compartment emptied it out and went through the console.  She says 
nothing was stolen from the vehicle and there was no damage.

1400 Carousel Rd18-050844 6/3/2018  11:00:00AM 91Z Miscellaneous Information

On 06/03/2018 at 11:41  hours, Officer Frazier (68396) reported a memo at 1400 Carousel Rd. Upon arrival, police spoke with 
Melvin Little. Melvin stated that his relative, Donna Mcnight and her husband, were over at his residence and an argument took 
place. Melvin called police but both parties left his residence prior to police arrival. Melvin stated in was only an argument. No 
further.

 

 

Highway 15//Jersey Pike Sb18-050862 6/3/2018  12:01:00PM 91Z Damaged Property Accidental

On 06/03/2018 at 12:12 hours, Officer Glenn, Clifton (60757) responded to a Damaged Property Accidental at Highway 15 @ 
Jersey pike sb.   I spoke with Altina Hale by telephone.  She says that she was driving south on Highway 153 near Jersey Pike, 
when she heard a loud pop and then a large crack appeared on the windshield of her 2018 Honda Civic.

953 Boynton Dr18-050863 6/3/2018  12:50:00PM 91Z Miscellaneous Information

On 06/03/2018 at 12:55 hours, Officer Mitchell Moss (0060171) reported a memo at 953 Boynton Dr.  Upon arrival Ms. Brooks 
stated that a Unknown male was cursing at her in the lobby of the apartment complex.  The male had walked inside the first floor 
of the apartments prior to police arrival.  The first floor was searched and the male was not found.  Ms. Brooks stated that she 
lived in the apartment complex; however, she refused to provide her current personal information.  The only thing she would 
state was police never help and only sit in their cars all day.



6/3/2018  12:00:51AM TO 6/9/2018  11:59:51PM

 

.

4630 Heiskell Dr18-050912 6/3/2018   3:09:00PM 91Z Miscellaneous Information

On 06/03/2018 at 15:09 hours, Officer Layne, Dakota (77578) reported a memo at 4630 Heiskell Dr. Police responded to a 
disorder at 4630 Heiskell Rd upon police located people in the area that stated there was 2 men in a physical altercation at the 
address but did not know there names. Multiple people stated the 2 men left in unknown cars in opposite directions. Police 
searched the area but was unable to locate the people involved. No further.

 

 
 

5526 Brainerd Rd18-050992 6/3/2018  10:27:00PM 26B Credit Card/ATM Fraud

On 06/03/2018 at 21:58 hours, Officer Joshua Blaine Price (76315) responded to a Credit Card/ATM Fraud at 5526 Brainerd Rd. 
Michael Ledford contacted Police to report that his Debit Card number had been used at a ATM (First TN Bank 5526 Brainerd 
Rd). He stated that he has not lost his card. His wife did use the card at Dollar General in Collegedale TN at 1221, 06/03/2018. 
She noticed that the clerk was acting strange but did not think nothing about it. But then their bank showed a charge going 
through twice and then being taken off. They thought that was strange and then later noticed that their card had been used at a 
ATM on Brainerd Rd. Mr Ledford was unable to get me a time stamp on when the money was taken. 
Card and Bank info. Digital Federal Credit Union. .
Nothing further at this time.

 
 
 

.

1016 N Larchmont Ave18-050998 6/3/2018   8:00:00PM 91Z Miscellaneous Information



6/3/2018  12:00:51AM TO 6/9/2018  11:59:51PM

On 06/03/2018 at 20:10 hours, Officer Day (79891) responded to a disorder at 1016 N Larchmont Ave. Upon arrival, I spoke with 
Kevin Bradley. Mr. Bradley stated that he has been allowing his cousin, Connie Freeman, to stay at his place. On this date, Ms. 
Freeman was intoxicated and began to act aggressively towards Mr. Bradley. Mr. Bradley stated he told her to leave, at which 
time she began to walk towards him in an aggressive manner. Mr. Bradley stated at that time he picked up the phone and told 
her he was calling the police. Ms. Freeman left before I arrived. Mr. Bradley stated he was not looking to press charges, he just 
wanted the situation documented. No further police action taken at this time.

602 N Parkdale Ave18-051000 6/3/2018   1:00:00AM 23F Theft from Motor Vehicle

On 06/03/2018 at 20:25 hours, Officer Hampton (78385) responded to a Theft from Motor Vehicle at 602 N Parkdale Ave. Police 
spoke with Mr. Sean Black.  Mr. Black stated his vehicles were broken into last night.  Mr. Black stated that his vehicles were left 
secured and parked in front of his residence at 01:00 hours this morning.  Mr. Black states that when he came out to his vehicles 
this morning at 07:00 hours, the doors on his gold 1992 Honda Civic ( ) and his mother-in-laws gold 1992 Honda 
Accord were open.  Mr. Black stated that someone had pried the driver's doors open, but that there was no damage to either 
vehicles.  Mr. Black stated that his wallet and contents were stolen from the Honda Civic.  Mr. Black stated that his Driver's 
License, ATM Card, EBT Card, and $60 cash were in his wallet.  Mr. Black made a fraud report (18-051008) in regard to his ATM 
Card being used.

Mr. Black stated that his vehicle has been broken into several times in the last few weeks, usually on Saturday mornings between 
the hours of 01:00 and 08:00.  Police added this residence to the Watchlist for the next two weeks.

3929 Manor Rd18-051030 6/3/2018  10:00:00PM 91Z Miscellaneous Information

On 06/03/2018 at 22:33 hours, Officer Benjamin Dessalines (77570) reported a memo at 3929 Manor Rd. Upon arrival, police 
made contact with Ms Rikeeda Lewis who stated that she wants to make a police report. Ms Lewis stated that her cousin (Ciara 
Allen) came to visit from Florida and she let her stay with her for a week but she uses her address to buy a vehicle. Ms Lewis 
stated that she in Section 8 and that could get her in trouble and she did not give her cousin permission to use her address. Ms 
Lewis stated that she just wants a report to get her to remove her to remove her address from her paperwork. No further at this 
time.

18300 Interstate 24 Eb18-051032 6/3/2018  10:00:00PM 240 MVT/Motorcycle

On 06/03/2018 at 22:10 hours, Officer Skyler Long (79892) responded to a MVT/Motorcycle at 18300 Interstate 24 Eb. I met the 
complainant, Mr. Terrance May, at the Auto Zone located at 3536 Brainerd Rd. Mr. May stated he was traveling east on I 24 and 
ran out of gas in his red Yamaha motorcycle. Mr. May stated he parked the motorcycle off the road and left his helmet on his bike 
to go get some gas. Once he arrived on scene a short time later, Mr. May noticed his bike and helmet were no where to be found 
where it was parked and reported it stolen. NCIC was contacted and assigned NIC V700337020 to the stolen motorcycle. No 
suspect information is known at this time. No further police action taken.

This case was reviewed and will not have any suspect leads at this time; the victim was contacted and did not have any new 
information in the case. Based on the lack of leads the case will be suspended, if any leads are later developed the case will then 
be assigned to an investigator for follow up.

2507 O Rear St18-051035 6/3/2018  10:20:00PM 91Z Miscellaneous Information

On 06/03/2018 at 22:23 hours, Officer Doub (79522) reported a memo at 2507 O Rear St. Police responded to a report of a 
Disorder with a Weapon at the above address. Upon arrival, police located several parties standing outside the residence in a 
verbal disorder with no weapons. Police separated the parties to gather information pertaining the the call. Police spoke to a Ms. 
Tanisha Terrell who lives at this address with her boyfriend, Mr. Stanley Postell. Ms. Terrell stated that her friend, Ms. Racquel 
Brown came by the house tonight and they were outside talking. Ms. Terrell stated that her boyfriend, Mr. Postell does not like 
Ms. Brown so he came outside creating an argument. Ms. Terrell stated that Mr. Postell called his mother to come pick him up 
because she does not want him there tonight and he agreed to leave. Mr. Postell's mother was on scene, Mrs. Priscilla Petty, to 
pick him up. All parties dispersed from the scene and no physical altercation occurred. No further at this time.

E 42nd St//6th Ave18-051043 6/3/2018  11:04:00PM 91Z Property Found



6/3/2018  12:00:51AM TO 6/9/2018  11:59:51PM

On 06/03/2018 at approximately 23:25 hours, Officer Caleb Brooks (62866) responded to a Property Found at E 42nd St / 6th 
Ave. Police were out at this location on a stolen vehicle recovery under CPD Complaint #18-048820. The vehicle had a TN 
registration of  on the vehicle which came back not stolen to a Mr. Cecil Hines. The license plate was removed and 
transported to the Chattanooga City Property Division for safekeeping for the actual owner of the property to retrieve. No suspect 
information or any additional information available at this time.

2288 Gunbarrel Rd18-051048 6/3/2018  10:30:00PM 23H Other Theft/Non-Specific

On 06/03/2018 at 23:50 hours, Officer T. Perocchi (79535) responded to a theft at 2288 Gunbarrel Road.  Police spoke with 
Karthikeya Durai Shanmuga Sundaram who stated his Iphone was stolen at the Best Buy parking lot.  He went there to sell a 
phone to a party he met through social media and when he allowed the suspect to look at the phone while sitting in her car she 
left in her vehicle without paying him for the phone.  He explained it was a black Iphone 8+ worth over one thousand dollars.  He 
stated that he does not wish to prosecute, but if located he would like his property returned.  The suspect was identified as Kyla 
Jones  and left in a silver Toyota with Tennessee registration

3300 Hixson Pike18-051056 6/3/2018  11:53:00PM 91Z Field Interview

On 06/03/2018 at 23:53 hours, Officer Josiah Blakney (78365) reported a memo at 3300 Hixson Pike.  I observed a black male 
wearing a black shirt and white shorts, carrying a backpack walking back and forth around the intersection of Hixson Pike and 
Lupton Dr.  I stopped to talk to him and he identified himself as Marvin Toney.  Marvin was scratching off a couple lottery tickets 
and told me he was waiting on a friend to pick him up.  No further.

 

261 Glenwood Dr18-051105 6/3/2018   9:00:00PM 240 MVT/Passenger Vehicle

This case was reviewed and will not have any suspect leads at this time; the victim was contacted and did not have any new 
information in the case. Based on the lack of leads the case will be suspended, if any leads are later developed the case will then 
be assigned to an investigator for follow up.

4900 Brainerd Rd18-051115 6/4/2018   6:30:00AM 91Z Property Found

On 06/04/2018 at 07:00 hours, Officer Cameka Bruce (63167) responded to a Property Found at 4900 Brainerd Rd. Upon arrival, 
the complainant, Joey Dube, reported a wallet was left inside the convenience store.  Mr. Dube stated as he checked the wallet 
but he did not find any identification inside.  The property was turned into the Property Division under Property #18-2443.

6000 Shallowford Rd18-051116 6/4/2018   7:54:00AM 91Z Field Interview

On 06/04/2018 at 07:54 hours, Officer William Bernitt (77564) reported a memo at 6000 Shallowford Rd.  Police were driving on 
6800 Shallowford when they saw Paula Castleberry walking down the sidewalk.  She was talking to herself and people who were 
not there and she was waving her arms around.  Police spoke with her.  It was obvious she had psychological problems.  Ms. 
Castleberry did not seem or say anything dangerous.  Ms. Castleberry voluntarily continued walking the way she was going and 
left the scene.  Nothing further.



6/3/2018  12:00:51AM TO 6/9/2018  11:59:51PM

3008 Alton Park Blvd18-051135 6/4/2018   8:39:00AM 91Z Miscellaneous Information

On 06/04/2018 at 08:27 hours, Officer Clemons, Jason (71960) responded to an open door at United Auto Recovery, 3008 Alton 
Park Blvd. Upon arrival I spoke with the complainant David Schwabenbauer, who stated that when he came into work this 
morning that the main door leading into the business office was wide open. I then saw that the gate to the property was still 
locked, and had not been broken or tampered with. I then cleared the building, and did not find a suspect or any signs of forced 
entry to the office. I then escorted Mr. Schwabenbauer through the building to see if anything was taken or disturbed. The 
complainant verified that everything appeared normal. No further action was taken.

100 Highway 153 Nb18-051176 6/4/2018  10:58:00AM 91Z Damaged Property Accidental

On 06/04/2018 at 11:00 hours, Officer Parda #1101  (78387) responded to a Damaged Property Accidental at 100 Highway 153 
Nb. 
Upon arrival at location vehicle fire had been controlled by CFD.  Driver, Bobby Demarus stated he was driving NB on Highway 
153 when he noticed his vehicle was on fire.  Mr Demarus pulled over to shoulder of the Highway and contacted Fire/Police.  
CFD was able to extinguish the fire quickly with minimal damage to vehicle.  Mr. Demarus contacted AAA to tow his vehicle to a 
repair shop.  I remained on scene parked behind the vehicle until tow arrived and removed vehicle from the highway shoulder.  
Nothing further to report.

5526 Brainerd Rd18-051178 6/3/2018   1:30:00PM 26B Credit Card/ATM Fraud

On 06/04/2018 at 10:48 hours, PIT McMahan (61444) responded to a Credit Card/ATM Fraud at 5526 Brainerd Rd at First Tn 
Bank. The victim said that he discovered that his debit card account had a fraudulent charge on it that was done out of 
jurisdiction in Ringgold, Ga. He then cancelled the account and afterwards someone attempted to use it to make a withdrawal for 
$100 at First Tn Bank on 6/3/18 at 1:30 pm Central Time. However, the transaction did not go through since the card was 
cancelled. He said that apparently someone had created a fake card with his card's number on it and was using it because he still 
has his card. This report was taken by phone.

1123 Highland Dr18-051201 6/4/2018   8:00:00AM 91Z Miscellaneous Information

On 06/04/2018 at 12:28 hours, Officer McCall (62872) reported a memo at 1123 Highland Dr. Upon arrival, officer McCall spoke 
to the complainant Gail Spitler. Ms. Spitler said she accidentaly shredded her registration sticker. Ms. Spitler said she needed a 
police report to get a new one.

19 S Crest Rd18-051213 6/4/2018  12:20:00PM 240 MVT/Passenger Vehicle

On 06/06/2018 at 21:40 hours, Officer Doub (79522) wrote a continuation/supplement for a MVT/Passenger Vehicle at 19 S Crest 
Rd. Police responded to a call of a suspicious vehicle around the 1200 block of Sholar Ave. Police located a Red Ford 
Ranger(TN ) sitting on the side of the street unoccupied. Police approached the vehicle and observed the front 
windshield had been busted out, as well as all of the windows on the vehicle minus the read window. Police observed that the 
vehicle had been ransacked and there were only miscellaneous papers throughout the vehicle with nothing of value left inside. 
Police ran the vehicle through Info Channel who confirmed it was stolen. Police attempted to contact the owner as well as 
dispatch attempting to contact the owner with no response. The vehicle was cleared out of NCIC at 2143 by NCIC dispatcher 
Brackett. Police had the vehicle towed by Doug Yates Towing and made it releasable to the owner. Police did not locate any 
suspects at this time. No further.

2001 E 23rd St18-051220 6/4/2018  12:27:00PM 26B Credit Card/ATM Fraud

On 06/04/2018 at 12:08 hours, Officer Glenn, Clifton (60757) responded to a Credit Card/ATM Fraud at 2001  E 23rd St.  I met 
with Richard Estermyer in the PSC lobby.  He says that on 2 June 2018, an unknown party used his First Tennessee Bank debit 
card information to withdraw $250.00.  He says then on 03 June, 2018, an unknown used the information again to withdraw 
$100.00.  He says that he is still in possession of the debit card.  Mt. Estermyer says that he has spoken with the bank and 
canceled his debit card.

2220 Hamilton Place Blvd18-051225 6/3/2018   5:00:00PM 26B Credit Card/ATM Fraud



6/3/2018  12:00:51AM TO 6/9/2018  11:59:51PM

On 06/04/2018 at 12:31  hours, Officer Glenn, Clifton (60757) responded to a Credit Card/ATM Fraud at 2220 Hamilton Place 
Blvd.   I met with Jonathan Kilgore in the PSC Lobby.  He says that on 02 June, 2018 between 1700 and 1900 hours, an unknown 
party used his debit card information to make three(3) ATM withdrawals totaling $70.00.  Mr. Kilgore stated that he is in 
possession of his debit card and does not know how his information was obtained.

3117 Parker Ln18-051240 6/4/2018   1:24:00PM 23G Theft of Vehicle Parts/Accessories

On 06/04/2018 at 13:15 hours, Officer Glenn, Clifton (60757) responded to a Theft of Vehicle Parts/Accessories at 3117 Parker 
Ln.  I spoke with Michael Stephens by telephone.  He says that he keeps his 2000 Jeep Cherokee parked on the back lot of 
Comfort Inn and Suites at the aforementioned location.  He says it has been there for about one month.  He says he discovered 
recently that Georgia license  has been stolen off of his vehicle.   The plate has been entered in NCIC # 
P656586611.

101 Browns Ferry Rd18-051253 6/4/2018   4:20:00PM 26A False Pretenses/Swindle/Confidenc

On 06/06/2018 at 12:34 hours, PIT Glenn, Clifton (60757) wrote a continuation/supplement for a False 
Pretenses/Swindle/Confidence Game at 101  Browns Ferry Rd.   I met Laura Ferguson in the PSC lobby.  She stated that she 
wanted to add the phone number of the two voice mails she received on 30 May 2018 at 1640 and 01  June 2018 at 1433.  She 
says that calls came from , claiming to be with Micro Soft.   The voice mails sounded to be recorded messages 
with a female voice.

 

18500 Hwy 24 Eb18-051293 6/4/2018   3:20:00PM 91Z Damaged Property Accidental

On 06/04/2018 at 15:40 hours, Officer Hauge (79528) responded to a Damaged Property Accidental at 18500 Hwy 24 EB. Police 
spoke with Ms. Yurjevic who stated she was driving down the highway when an unknown object came out from under a 
semi-truck in front of her. She stated that the object rolled down the road toward her vehicle and struck the vehicles front bumper 
came up and struck the front windshield on the driver side causing glass to shatter inside the vehicle. Ms. Yurjevic stated she did 
not need EMS and was ok.

7604 Standifer Gap Rd18-051296 6/4/2018   3:44:00PM 91Z Miscellaneous Information

On 06/04/2018 at 16:14 hours, Officer Stansberry (61910) reported a memo at 7604 Standifer Gap Rd. Officers met with the 
complainant (Ashunti Garner) at the Sprint store 2100 Hamilton Place Blvd. Complainant stated her roommate (Maria Leonard) 
was moving out and refused to give back a cell-phone and pay the bill provided at to her. Complainant stated she was at the 
Sprint store and canceled the number . Complainant requested the incident be documented in case the phone is 
not returned within a few days.

3709 Cummings Hwy18-051310 6/4/2018   4:21:00PM 91Z Miscellaneous Information

On 06/04/2018 at 16:28 hours, Officer M livesay #638 reported a memo at 3709 Cummings Hwy. Police responded to assist an 
officer with Hamilton County Sherriff’s office who got out with a party, Mr. James Robey, who was a passenger in a suspicious 
vehicle parked at the Mapco. Police made contact with and detained Mr. Robey, as well as 2 other parties who were in the 
vehicle, and, after receiving consent to search, searched each party and the vehicle. Police were able to verify with the 
Magistrate’s office that the warrants on Mr. Robey were not valid. Police did not find anything illegal on either party or in the 
vehicle. No further police action needed at this time.



6/3/2018  12:00:51AM TO 6/9/2018  11:59:51PM

1853 Gunbarrel Rd18-051314 6/4/2018   2:50:00PM 26A False Pretenses/Swindle/Confidenc

On 06/04/2018 at 16:12 hours, Officer Johnston (75394) responded to a False Pretenses/Swindle/Confidence Game at 1853 
Gunbarrel Rd. On scene I spoke with the Complainant ( Jennifer Lopez- store manager) who stated that a Mark Melton came into 
the store trying to pick up three iPhones, valued at $4000, that were under another account name. The complainant was informed 
by her staff that this party had been in the store several times over the last month attempting to access other accounts. The 
complainant was able to get a drivers license from the party and then informed him that what he was doing was fraud. The party 
then left without getting the phones. AT&T does not wish to prosecute at this time. The complainant was not able to get a phone 
number for the party. Nothing else follows.

 
 

 
 

.

 
 

 
 

 
 

 

1725 Holly Oak Ln18-051349 6/4/2018   5:56:00PM 26B Credit Card/ATM Fraud

On 06/04/2018 at 18:00 hours, Officer Johnston (75394) responded to a Credit Card/ATM Fraud at 1725 Holly Oak Ln. On scene 
I spoke with the complainant (Amanada Brown) who stated that she noticed atm withdrawals from her debit card this morning. 
She contacted her bank and was informed to file a police report due to her being in bankruptcy. The complainant stated that the 
card has already been turned off. She continued to state that there had been two withdrawals. The first being $400 and the 
second being for $180. Nothing else follows.

838 Palmetto St18-051368 6/4/2018   6:57:00PM 91Z Property Found

On 06/04/2018 at 19:02 hours, Officer Thomas Plunkett (79536) responded to a suspicious person at 838 Palmetto St. Upon 
arrival, Police spoke with Ms. Ruggerio. Ms. Ruggerio stated that a B/M on crutches with a very, very dark complexion got out 
and was on crutches hobbled over to the passenger side. A White F/M with Red hair and heavy set got out and got in the driver’s 
seat.  A B/M got out of the back right passenger side with a green back pack and walked towards the fence and ran back to the 
car but without the backpack. The B/M got back in the car and left, Ms. Ruggerio stated that it looked to be a white Buick Regal 
possibly early 2000’s, with a drive out tag. Police located the backpack and found inside 3 cases of 22 LR rounds, a box of 9mm 
rounds and a box of 45mm rounds. The backpack also contained red and white Nike high top shoes and a purple polo shirt. Ms. 
Ruggerio had no further suspect info and just wanted to make police aware. Found property taken to property. Nothing further at 
this time.

1702 Walker Ave18-051380 6/4/2018   7:10:00PM 91Z Miscellaneous Information



6/3/2018  12:00:51AM TO 6/9/2018  11:59:51PM

On 06/04/2018 at 19:30 hours, Officer Seech (79539) responded to a Disorder at 1702 Walker Ave. The call originally came out 
as a Disorder With a Weapon. Once on scene officers contact Mr. Paul Bell and Ms. Latasor Dews, who were arguing. Due to the 
nature of the original call Ms. Dews was briefly detained while the investigation took place. Per Mr. Bell, he had been in a verbal 
disorder with Ms. Dews who was intoxicated. Ms. Dews sprayed a small amount of lighter fluid outside the house and stated that 
she would burn the house down. Mr. Bell stated that at no point did Ms. Dews attempt to start a fire or have any lighters in her 
possession. I spoke with Ms. Dews who stated the same and that she wanted everyone to leave her house. All parties on scene 
agreed to leave and Ms. Dews was free to leave. At this point it was determined that no further police action was necessary. 
These events occurred within the city limits of Chattanooga, TN.

1011 Gadd Rd18-051397 6/4/2018   8:25:00PM 91Z Field Interview

On 06/04/2018 at 20:30 hours, Officer Smith, Zachary (77584) reported a memo at 1011  Gadd Rd.  Upon arriving I made contact 
with Karrie Meeks who stated she was waiting on a friend to bring her vehicle back.  She also stated she feared the "Cartel" 
would kill her if she spoke to Police.  Ms.  Meeks was wearing very little clothing at the time of Police arrival and it was clear she 
had been drinking heavily.  Police calmed her down and left the area with no incident.   Nothing follows.

 
 

 
 

 

 

1019 W 37th St18-051422 6/4/2018   9:30:00PM 91Z Miscellaneous Information

On 06/04/2018 at 21:40 hours, Officer T. Durham (77571) reported a memo at 1019 W 37th St. Upon arrival I spoke with Mr. 
Michael Green, Mr. Green stated he was house sitting for his neighbor, Christa Carter, and noticed her lights in her house where 
on. Mr. Green then called Ms. Carter to gain consent for Myself and other Officers to search the residence as there were no signs 
of break in. Officers searched the house but nothing appeared out of place. Nothing further.

3604 Brainerd Rd18-051442 6/4/2018  10:00:00PM 91Z Field Interview

On 06/04/2018 at 22:17 hours, Officer Benjamin Dessalines (77570) was dispatched to a suspicious person at 3604 Brainerd Rd. 
Upon arrival, police spoke with the complainant (Mr James) who stated that an unknown B/F who was in the parking lot of the gas 
station panhandling but when she realized that he was calling the police she walked away. Police searched the area for the 
description given of the suspect and was able to locate Ms Alexandria Brazelton. Ms Brazelton stated that she is homeless and 
she was just walking. Police checked her ID for warrant and came back negative. No further at this time.

8604 N Hickory Valley Rd18-051448 6/4/2018  11:00:00PM 91Z Suspicious Activity



6/3/2018  12:00:51AM TO 6/9/2018  11:59:51PM

On 06/04/2018 at 23:25 hours, Officer T. Perocchi (79535) reported a memo at 8604 N Hickory Valley Road.  Police met with 
Zane Jones, a customer at the gas station at this address.  He stated that a woman went into the bathroom and was in there for 
about twenty minutes.  He also said when she exited the bathroom, she was smoking a cigarette and in the store and her 
behavior was not normal.  Police met with the woman who was identified as Lora Redman at her friends vehicle.  Her and her 
friend, Amy Miller explained that they were on their way to Florida to stay with a friend.  Redman stated she was in the bathroom 
cleaning up and was tired from the amount of traveling she had done.  Both parties were ran in NCIC and did not have any active 
warrants.  They left the scene without incident.

3660 Brainerd Rd18-051456 6/4/2018  11:00:00PM 91Z Field Interview

On 06/04/2018 at 23:44 hours, Officer Benjamin Dessalines (77570) was dispatched to a suspicious vehicle at 3660 Brainerd Rd. 
Upon arrival, police locate a vehicle with a TN license plate  parked at that location with the windows down. Police 
proceeded to check the vehicle and locate a B/M laying inside the vehicle. The B/M was identified as Mr Dalvin 
Danforth-Thompson who stated that he was just in a verbal argument with his girl and decided to come park there to cool off. The 
vehicle came back negative stolen. Police also checked his ID for the possible warrant and came back negative. the No further at 
this time.

2300 Market St18-051512 6/5/2018   5:35:00AM 91Z Field Interview

On 06/05/2018 at 05:35 hours, Officer J. Cannon 1089 got out with a bicyclist at 2300 Market St. I got out with Adgie Hardy who 
was riding a bike North on Market St on the Southbound side. Mr. Hardy stated he was running late for work at Pilgrims Pride and 
was trying to cut some time by riding straight down Market. I told Mr. Hardy that his riding towards traffic was especially 
dangerous for him due to him not having lights on the front of his bicycle. Mr. Hardy stated he would ride on the correct side from 
this moment forward at would also get a light to put on the front. NCIC system was down and not giving returns at the time of this 
encounter. No further police action taken at this time.

1125 E 14th St18-051515 6/5/2018   7:18:00AM 290 Vandalism

On 06/05/2018 at 06:25 hours, Officer Roth (63831) responded to a Vandalism at 1125 E 14th St. Upon arrival I spoke to the 
victim, Abo Mokhtar. He stated that he came outside this morning to find that an unknown suspect had damaged his fence. One 
post along with a main post for his gate had been damaged at some point in the night. He estimated the cost of repairing the 
fence and gate at $1500. There is currently no suspect information at this time.

18 S Germantown Rd18-051524 6/5/2018  12:01:00AM 290 Vandalism

On 06/05/2018 at 07:18 hours, Officer Glenn, Clifton (60757) responded to a Vandalism at 18 S Germantown Rd.  I spoke with 
Hugh Reece by telephone.  He says sometime during the night, an unknown party used a brick to try to break into his 2006 Jeep 
Commander.  He says that the unknown struck and cracked the left side front window and then tried to break the left side rear 
window, but failed.   He says the brick was still laying beside the vehicle.  He says the repair cost is unknown at this time.

 
.

2727 Rossville Blvd18-051575 6/5/2018  10:00:00AM 91Z Property Found



6/3/2018  12:00:51AM TO 6/9/2018  11:59:51PM

On 06/05/2018 at 10:48 hours I, Officer King (78347), responded to a Property Found at 2727 Rossville Blvd.  While in the 
MAPCO I was approached by one of the employees who showed me a bank bag that she said she found on the floor of the men's 
restroom.  The bank bag had a lock on it but the zipper was broken and there were no contents in the bag.  I asked dispatch if 
there had been reports of a bank bag being stolen and they said that there was no such reports.  I turned the bag into property.  
No further Police action was necessary.

1803 E 23rd St18-051590 6/5/2018  11:30:00AM 240 Theft & Recovery/Passenger Vehic

On 06/05/2018 at 11:45 hours, Officer King (78347) responded to a Theft & Recovery/Passenger Vehicle at 1803 E 23rd St. Upon 
arrival I spoke with the victim, Mr. Wendell Bruce who said that an unknown white mail had stolen his truck that had multiple 
pieces of landscaping equipment on it.  When I spoke to Mr. Bruce he said that the truck had a GPS locater on it and said it was 
showing around the 600 Block of S. Holtzclaw Ave.  After hearing the possible location of the vehicle on the radio Officer Bruce 
(#506) was able to locate the vehicle.  When Officer Bruce found the vehicle the suspect had already fled the scene.  Mr. Bruce 
was able to recover his vehicle and the property that had not been taken from the trailer.  Two items were taken from the trailer 
by the suspect when he fled, a Stihl backpack leaf blower and a Stihl Chainsaw. The vehicle had been crashed by the suspect 
and had to be towed, Mr. Bruce called for his own tow.  Detective Matt Rogers was notified of the theft.  Officer Bruce has the 
information for the landscaping equipment that was stolen and will be adding it to the report.

On 06/05/2018 at 14:00 hours, Officer Chris Bruce (77567) wrote a continuation/supplement for a Theft & Recovery/Passenger 
Vehicle at 1803 E 23rd St. 

After locating the truck on South Holtzclaw Ave, the following was discovered:  A Stihl Blower and Chainsaw were taken from the 
work truck.  The rest of the Lawn Equipment was recovered from the truck.

There is video of the incident from two local business: Hinton's Man Up Business and Bojanles.

Auto Theft Investigators was made aware of the circumstances of the incident along with the video.

7107 Saratoga Ln18-051595 6/5/2018   8:00:00AM 91Z Property Found

On 06/05/2018 at 12:25 hours, Officer Mansell (39154) responded to a Property Found at 7107 Saratoga Ln. Complainant called 
from 1300 Chestnut to turn in a TN drivers license she found in her driveway. DL taken to property. 
property # 18-2466

1740 Gunbarrel Rd18-051627 6/4/2018   1:30:00PM 26B Credit Card/ATM Fraud

On 06/05/2018 at 13:21  hours, Officer Glenn, Clifton (60757) responded to a Credit Card/ATM Fraud at 1740 Gunbarrel Rd.  I 
spoke with Jeff Dillinger by telephone.  He says that at an unknown time on Monday 04 June, 2018, an unknown party used his 
Capital Bank debit card information to make three(3) ATM withdrawals at an Atlantic Capital Bank ATM at the above listed 
address.  He says that there were withdrawals of $200.00, $200.00 and $20.00.  Mr. Dillinger gave his VISA debit card number as 

2400 Williams St18-051639 6/5/2018   1:31:00PM 91Z Suspicious Activity



6/3/2018  12:00:51AM TO 6/9/2018  11:59:51PM

On 06/05/2018 at 13:46 hours, Officer Clemons, Jason (71960) was flagged down at Raceway, 2528 Broad St for a Disorder 
Prevention at Motel 6, 2440 Williams St. While at the raceway gas station I was approached by a Paul Harper who stated that he 
was a lock smith for Rick's Lock & Key. Mr. Harper stated that he was going to Motel 6 at 2400 Williams St to unlock a silver 
2003 Ford Explorer XLT. Mr. Harper then stated that his boss had told him to make sure he had someone with him, as the 
business and area has a poor safety reputation. I then followed Mr. Harper to Motel 6, where the vehicle was located and got out 
with a Kenneth Davis ) and Jahala Sanders (  who were standing with the Silver Ford.  While Mr. Harper 
began looking over the vehicle, I saw Ms. Sanders walk away quickly from the vehicle, and went in the Motel. I then began a 
Field Interview with Mr. Davis to gain information regarding the vehicle and the purpose of their stay. Mr. Davis stated that the 
vehicle was his girlfriend's, and that they would only be there for a brief time. I then ran the vehicle information through Info 
Channel to see if it was possibly stolen; it was not. Once Ms. Sanders returned to her boyfriend's side, I then began a Field 
Interview with her. I then ran both Mr. Davis and Ms. Sanders' Information through Info Channel, and both came back negative 
on any warrants for arrest. Mr. Harper stated that he no longer needed police assistance once he was informed the vehicle wasn't 
stolen, and the parties he was working for did not have any warrants and he found them to not be threatening to him. No further 
action was taken.

1135 E 3rd St18-051646 6/5/2018   2:50:00PM 240 MVT/Passenger Vehicle

On 06/05/2018 at 14:54 hours, Officer Michael Holloway (24522) responded to a MVT/Passenger Vehicle at 1135 E 3rd St. Police 
spoke with Reginald Young who stated that he parked his 2007 GMC on the parking lot at the above address and was helping 
unload a truck  when a unknown party got into the vehicle and drove off. No one seen the driver, after checking the security 
tapes, it showed the vehicle pulling off the parking lot, but did not show the driver. The vehicle went east on 3rd street. I entered 
the vehicle into NCIC.

2929 Fernleaf Ln18-051671 6/4/2018   3:00:00AM 91Z Property Lost

On 06/05/2018 at 15:07 hours,  PIT McMahan (61444) responded to a Property Lost at 2929 Fernleaf Ln at the victim's home. 
The victim said that he last had his phone in an Uber Taxi when he was dropped off at his home Monday morning around 3 am. 
After he had been home a while, he finally realized that he had left the phone in the Taxi. He later contacted the driver but his 
phone was gone. He was able to track his phone by GPS to an address: 167 Hunt Ave. However, he later tracked the phone to 
the Signal Mtn area where he finally lost contact with it and he now has no idea where it is. This report was taken by phone.

 
 

 

.

 

.

4120 Shallowford Rd18-051712 6/5/2018   5:03:00PM 91Z Miscellaneous Information

On 06/05/2018 at 17:15 hours, Officer Bell (79882) reported a memo at 4120 Shallowford Rd. Upon arrival I spoke with Apryl 
hunter who told me that her daughter, Cherish Hunter, had been acting stranger and was very aggressive towards her. Ms. Apryl 
told me that her daughter lived in Altanta and believed that she was off her medication and wanted the local Police department to 
check on her. Ms. Apryl told me that the local PD said that she needed to have us to complete a report. I told Ms. Apryl that I 
would complete a report for her. No further action was needed.

1709 Chickamauga Loop18-051721 6/5/2018   4:32:00PM 91Z Vehicle Recovered Stolen Outside 



6/3/2018  12:00:51AM TO 6/9/2018  11:59:51PM

On 06/05/2018 at 16:32 hours, I, Ofc. Gunn 351, responded to a Vehicle Recovered Stolen Outside of Chattanooga at 1709 
Chickamauga Loop. Upon arrival, I spoke with Jimmy Scott. Mr. Scott stated that he had towed an abandoned vehicle, and then 
had realized that it was stolen. The vehicle was a silver 2005 Honda Civic ( ). I attempted to notify the owner, Tanner 
Johnson, however, I was not able to get in touch with Mr. Johnson. I took the vehicle out of NCIC under NIC #V119570547. There 
is no suspect information in this case. Nothing further.

This case will be a recovery other agency and will not be investigated by this department; the follow up will be conducted by the 
agency the vehicle was reported stolen to at the time of its theft.

 

1826 Reggie White Blvd18-051732 6/5/2018   5:41:00PM 91Z Field Interview

On 06/05/2018 at 17:50 hours, Officer Jonathan Waltero (79887) responded to a suspicious person at 1826 Reggie White Blvd. 
Once on scene, I made contact with Mr. Beck.

I asked Mr. Beck what he was doing around the skate park. Mr. Beck stated he was at the dog park filling up his water bottle and 
he was on his way to the Salvation army.

Upon running Mr. Beck, he had no active warrants. Mr. Beck departed the scene on foot.

 
 

 
 
 
 
 

2655 Glass St18-051769 6/5/2018   7:40:00PM 91Z Miscellaneous Information

On 06/05/2018 at 19:55 hours, Officer Day (79891) responded to a suspicious party at 2655 Glass St. Upon arrival, I  spoke with 
Jawanna and Kimberly who stated they were walking home and noticed a man following them. When the two got home, Jawanna 
looked out the window because she heard a noise and when she did she saw him in the alley behind their house. The man was 
wearing a gray shirt, with green shorts, and appeared to be in his mid 20's. Police scanned the area for the individual, but could 
not locate him. The mother came and picked up the two kids and took them to work with her. No further action taken at this time.

1411 E 28th St18-051775 6/5/2018   8:15:00PM 91Z Miscellaneous Information

On 06/05/2018 at 20:19 hours, Officer Christopher Liberto (37420) responded to a Suspicious Person Call at 1411  E 28th St. 
Upon arrival, I spoke with Ms. Adrian Puckett who stated a group  of people that were hanging out across the street of her 
residence were being loud. I spoke with the parties involved and they stated they would keep it down and cause no trouble. 
Nothing further at this time.



6/3/2018  12:00:51AM TO 6/9/2018  11:59:51PM

2020 Gunbarrel Rd18-051782 6/5/2018   8:00:00PM 23C Shoplifting

On 06/06/2018 at 16:37 hours, Officer Stone (79915) wrote a continuation/supplement for a Shoplifting at 2020 Gunbarrel Rd. At 
around 1500 hours on June 6th 2018, Ms. Kathleen Chill notified of an update to the theft from the night prior. After further review 
the total value of the property stolen is $2019.78. Nothing else follows.

1058 Graysville Rd18-051795 6/5/2018   9:00:00PM 91Z Miscellaneous Information

On 06/05/2018 at 22:15 hours, Officer T. Perocchi (79535) responded to a suspicious bag at 1058 Graysville Road.  Police spoke 
with complainant Archie Layne, who stated they saw a bag on the property of their church and was concerned it had contraband.  
Police searched the bag to identify the owner and was not able to.  No contraband was found during the search.  The bag was 
transported to the property division for safekeeping (18-2482).

 
 

.

709 Broad St18-051806 6/5/2018  10:53:00PM 91Z Miscellaneous Information

On 06/05/2018 at 22:55 hours, Officer R. Petty (75408) reported a memo at 709 Broad St. Upon arrival I spoke with Mr. Michael 
Scott, who stated that he is an Uber driver and that for the past 2 days someone has reported to Uber that he was driving while 
intoxicated. This is causing Uber to place a temporary ban on his account so that he can not work. Mr. Scott believes that a 
former employer, Mr. Tracy Jarvis, is the one filing the complaints due to the fact that they started shortly after he ran into him on 
a pickup 2 days ago. Mr. Scott stated that the complaint was filed approximately an hour prior to him contacting police, Mr. Scott 
showed no signs of intoxication and requested a police report to reflect his condition, no further.

900 Blk King St18-051809 6/5/2018   6:18:00PM 91Z Field Interview

On 06/05/2018 at 18:20 hours, Officer Thomas Plunkett (79536) responded to a suspicious person at 900 Blk King St. On patrol, 
police noticed Mr. Lollis bent over and appeared to be throwing up and his pants almost on the ground.
 Police asked Mr. Lollis is he was ok he stated that he was, Mr. Lollis stated that he had just gotten out of jail and was homeless 
and was staying at the shelter on E 11th st.
Police ran Mr. Lollis through NCIC and was clear from any wants or warrants.
Police believe Mr. Lollis was ok and was free to go. 
No further action taken

 
 

 
.

2400 Rossville Blvd18-051813 6/5/2018  11:10:00PM 91Z Field Interview



6/3/2018  12:00:51AM TO 6/9/2018  11:59:51PM

On 06/05/2018 at 23:21  hours, Officer Creighton, Trevor (73490) reported a memo at 2400 Rossville Blvd.

Once on scene police attempted to locate the caller without success. At this point police located a Mr. Keyon Hinton who stated 
he was told by a passerby that there was a man that walked by his fence and looked like his hand was over his fence line. Mr. 
Hinton went on to tell police he didn't see the man but was also told by the passerby that it looked like he may have been bitten 
by one of his dogs. At this point police waited at the scene for the caller to arrive and attempted to have dispatch call him back to 
the scene several times without success.
Police then told Mr. Hinton to call police back if he needed anything at a later point. 

Nothing further to report.
No criminal activity observed.

3417 Clio Ave18-051844 6/6/2018  12:52:00AM 91Z Miscellaneous Information

On 06/06/2018 at 00:52 hours, Officer Buttry (60658) responded to a disorder at 3417 Clio Ave. Upon arrival police spoke to two 
brothers Tramicheal  and Travonte Bennett who were in a verbal disorder over a can of peas. Both parties agreed to end the 
argument. No further.

634 Gurley St18-051861 6/4/2018  10:00:00PM 240 MVT/Passenger Vehicle

On 06/06/2018 at 14:35 hours, Officer Matthew Rogers (60443) wrote a continuation/supplement for a MVT/Passenger Vehicle at 
634 Gurley St. 

                            On 06-06-18 at approximately 0844 hrs. I, Det. M. Rogers #925, was assigned case# 18-051861. Upon 
reviewing the case it was discovered that the vehicle in question had been involved in a wreck and recovered prior to it being 
reported stolen. I then contacted the victim who had no further information to add other than what was already reported. The 
vehicle was never entered into NCIC. Due to the recovery of the vehicle and the lack of suspect information this case will now be 
suspended until further information is learned that would change that status. Victim stated the same story as what was reported 
and adamant about the vehicle being stolen.

309 S Kelley St18-051862 6/6/2018   1:50:00AM 91Z Field Interview

On 06/06/2018 at 01:56 hours, Officer Veronica Thomas (75141) reported a memo at 309 S Kelley St. While on Patrol Police 
observed a unknown male laying on the sidewalk next to closed businesses. Police stopped to check the well-being of the man. 
Police spoke with male party later identified as  Mr. Coleman Kouto who stated he wanted to go to Brianerd Rd. Police then 
asked for Mr. Kouto information and or identification. Mr. Kouto became defensive and spoke with a aggressive and 
argumentative tone. Police explained why they were speaking with him and offered to take him to Brianerd Rd. Mr. gave his 
information but continued to speak aggressively. Police ran Mr. Koutos information with a return of no warrants Police offered Mr. 
Kouto a ride. Mr. Kouto refused police assistance. No Further

 
 

 

3600 Hixson Pike18-051880 6/6/2018   5:04:00AM 91Z Miscellaneous Information



6/3/2018  12:00:51AM TO 6/9/2018  11:59:51PM

On 06/06/2018 at 06:07 hours, Officer Veloz (75390) reported a memo at 3600 Hixson Pike. Upon arrival to the scene I 
encountered Scott Crump who was hiding behind a truck at this location. Scott was afraid and smelled of alcohol. Scott stated 
that he didnt know why a man in a vehicle was following him. I ran scott for active warrants, none were found. I asked Scott how 
he came to be at this location and he stated that he left his home off of Maulduth just down the road and didnt know how he 
ended up there. I took Scott back to the address, where his vehicle was properly parked in the driveway. I asked Scott if he knew 
the key pad lock to get inside his residence, which he did. I left him in the care of his roomate who was on scene. The roomate 
stated that he had been looking for Scott but couldnt find him. Scott's roomate stated that he would take care of Scott for the rest 
of the night. Nothing further to report at this time.

134 Signal Hills Dr18-051913 6/6/2018   8:40:00AM 91Z Miscellaneous Information

On 06/06/2018 at 09:02 hours, Officer K. Otto (63031) and Officer N. Gurnsey (79875) responded to an Abandoned Auto at 134 
Signal Hills Dr.  Upon arrival Police observed a white Chrysler Pacifica, TN  parked in the roadway in front of 134 
Signal Hills Dr.  A registration check was conducted, the vehicle did not come back as stolen and is registered to a Megan 
Jackson of 191  Hall Rd Signal Mountain TN.  Info channel dispatchers contacted the Sequatchie County Sheriff's Office in an 
attempt to contact Ms. Jackson.  At the time of this report, Ms. Jackson could not be contacted.  The vehicle was transported by 
Cain's Wrecker Service to their holding lot.

2600 14th Ave18-051916 6/6/2018   8:45:00AM 91Z Miscellaneous Information

On 06/06/2018 at 08:47 hours, Officer Coleman (79519) reported a memo at 2600 14th Ave. Police arrived on scene and made 
contact with Courtney Brown who stated that a maintenance man used her bathroom and stole tennis shoes while he was fixing 
the A/C in her government housing unit. Police also spoke to Ann Jackson who is a clerk at the East Lake housing office. Ms. 
Jackson stated that Ms. brown came in the office and began yelling that someone stole her shoes. Ms. Jackson stated that Ms. 
Brown threatened her. Ms Jackson did not wish to press charges.  Nothing further to report.

16 N Larchmont Ave18-051920 6/6/2018  12:01:00AM 290 Vandalism

On 06/06/2018 at 08:39 hours, Officer Glenn, Clifton (60757) responded to a Vandalism at 16 N Larchmont Ave.  I spoke with 
Sherry Hudson by telephone.  She says that her 2012 Nissan Altima was parked on the side of the street in front of her residence.  
She says that sometime during the night, an unknown party broke off the left side rear view mirror of her vehicle.  She says it 
must be vandalism as there was no other damage to the vehicle.  She says that she has not yet obtained an estimate of repair.  
She says that she does not know the repair cost.

 
 

301 Cherokee Blvd18-051967 6/6/2018   3:00:00AM 23H Other Theft/Non-Specific

On 06/06/2018 at 11:27 hours, Officer Glenn, Clifton (60757) responded to a Other Theft/Non-Specific at 301  Cherokee Blvd.  I 
spoke with John Dooley by telephone.  He says in the early morning hours this morning, an unknown party stole his bicycle from 
outside of his apartment.  He says the bike was not secured.  Mr. Dooley says it is a Trek 26inch road bike matte black with red 
accents and a rack over the rear tire.  He says it is a new bicycle that he paid $1200.00 for.

1949 Gunbarrel Rd18-051978 6/6/2018   9:00:00AM 91Z Damaged Property Accidental



6/3/2018  12:00:51AM TO 6/9/2018  11:59:51PM

On 06/06/2018 at 12:07 hours, Officer Glenn, Clifton (60757) responded to a Damaged Property Accidental at 1949 Gunbarrel 
Rd.  I spoke with Abrigail Delaney by telephone.  She says that sometime this morning, the right side rear window of her 2014 
Honda Accord (GA ) was shattered.  She insist that it was not vandalism and says that she does not know how the 
window was broken.  She says that there was no entry into the vehicle, only the window broken.

4567 Tricia Dr18-051995 6/6/2018   1:44:00PM 240 MVT/Passenger Vehicle

The victim located his vehicle and officers did the recovery and removed the vehicle from NCIC, the case due to the lack of 
leads will remain suspended.

3521 Central Ave18-052003 6/6/2018   1:41:00PM 91Z Vehicle Recovered Stolen Outside 

On 06/06/2018 at 13:47 hours, Officer Eric Lee Milchak, Sr. (60836) responded to a Vehicle Recovered Stolen Outside of 
Chattanooga at 3521  Central Ave., Southside Community Park.

On 06/06/2018 at 1347 hours Chattanooga City Park and Rec employees cutting the grass in a back field located a stolen silver 
2018 Nissan Versa bearing TN tag and VIN#3N1CN7AP4JL809351. The vehicle was reported stolen out of Bradley County TN 
under Bradley County S.O. #18-23976. Police dispatched contacted Bradley County S.O. and verified the stolen vehicle hit 
NIC#V630290643. Due to major dashboard damage Yates Wrecker and Recovery responded to tow the vehicle. Bradley County 
will be removing the vehicle from stolen status and make owner notifications. No further action was taken at this time.

This case will be a recovery other agency and will not be investigated by this department; the follow up will be conducted by the 
agency the vehicle was reported stolen to at the time of its theft.

3929 Manor Rd18-052027 6/6/2018   3:00:00PM 290 Vandalism

On 06/06/2018 at 15:33 hours, Officer Ayriel Novak (70780) responded to a Vandalism at 3929 Manor Rd Apt 221.  On scene I 
spoke with the complainant, Cedrillia Benford, who stated she and her "man friend", Clifford "CJ" Lindsey, had gotten into a 
verbal argument.  Ms. Benford stated Mr. Lindsey took her Iphone 8+ and broke it in the street.  Ms. Benford stated Mr. Lindsey 
then took her keys.  Mr. Lindsey eventually returned her keys to a mutual friend.  Ms. Benford stated she did not want to 
prosecute at this time.

2220 Hamilton Place Blvd18-052038 6/6/2018   2:29:00PM 23C Shoplifting

On 06/06/2018 at 15:38 hours, Officer Juan E. Cuba (79521) responded to a Shoplifting at Old Navy located at  2220 Hamilton 
Place Blvd. Upon arrival, police made contact with the business manager Ms. Kaylee Brunner. Ms. Brunner stated that two 
females came inside the business at around 1429 hours. They picked up two bags and started to fill them up with merchandise 
from the business. One of the females left to get their vehicle as the other one left through the back door. It is unknown what type 
of vehicle the suspects where driving. Police searched the area for the suspects but were not able to locate them at this point. No 
further.

 
 
 

.



6/3/2018  12:00:51AM TO 6/9/2018  11:59:51PM

2004 Gunbarrel Rd18-052048 6/6/2018   3:54:00PM 23C Shoplifting

On 06/06/2018 at 15:58 hours, Officer Juan E. Cuba (79521) responded to a Shoplifting at 2004 Gunbarrel Rd. Upon arrival, 
police made contact with the business manager Ms. Eman Kiswani. Ms. Kiswani stated that she observed a female grab 3 pairs 
of sunglasses and hide them inside her purse. When Ms. Kiswani tried to stop the suspect, the suspect challenged Ms. Kiswani at 
which point Ms. Kiswani decided to stay back and wait for police to arrive. The female got inside a green Honda where a male 
was waiting for her. Police searched the area but was not able to find the suspects. The value of the stolen merchandise was 
around $900. No further.

4004 Rossville Blvd18-052050 6/6/2018   3:58:00PM 91Z Miscellaneous Information

On 06/06/2018 at 16:05 hours, Officer Christopher Liberto (37420) responded to a Disorder at 4004 Rossville Blvd. Upon arrival, I 
spoke with a witness who stated she saw Mr. Richard West and a White Female arguing and the Woman hit Mr. Richard West. 
When I spoke to Mr. West he stated they were having an argument and nothing more. The female was not found at the scene. 
Another call came out on 06/06/2018 at 1625 hours from the female but again I was unable to locate the caller. Nothing further at 
this time.

1100 N Moore Rd18-052053 6/6/2018   4:00:00PM 91Z Property Found

On 06/06/2018 at 16:01  hours, Officer Hampton (78385) responded to a Property Found at 1100 N Moore Rd.   Police found a 
white and purple zebra duffel bag in the street in front of Brainerd High School.  The bag contained several misc clothing items, 
candy, personal hygiene items, and a small black speaker.  There was nothing in the bag to identify who the items belong to.

 
 

 

 
 

.

656 N Moore Rd18-052130 6/6/2018   6:28:00PM 290 Vandalism

On 06/06/2018 at 18:28, I, Ofc. Gunn 351, responded to a call of a Vandalism at 656 N Moore Rd. Upon arrival, I spoke with 
Matthew Miller. Mr. Miller stated that a white male had attempted to kick in his back door. Specifically, Mr. Miller's roommate, 
who was home, heard a loud noise coming from the rear of the inside of the house. When the roommate went to check on the 
noise, he saw a white male with a gray t-shirt, blue jeans, a brown scruffy beard, and brown short hair entering through the back 
door of the house. The roommate stated that when the suspect saw him, that the suspect took off running out of the back of the 
house. It was then apparent to the roommate that the suspect had kicked in the back door due to the door being broken. The 
reporting individual called police an hour after the incident, so there was little to no chance of police finding the suspect still in the 
area. There is no further suspect information. Nothing further.

2301 4th Ave18-052146 6/6/2018   8:50:00PM 91Z Field Interview



6/3/2018  12:00:51AM TO 6/9/2018  11:59:51PM

On 06/06/2018 at 20:55 hours, Officer Van Ness (75389) responded to 2301 4th Ave. in response to a suspicious party.  Upon 
arrival Officers were told the party was last seen heading north on Willow St. and that she was at the Exxon Gas station at 2301  
4th ave. asking people for money and causing a disorder.  She was described as a black female wearing all pink, approximately 
100 lbs.  Officer Van Ness observed the female walking South on the 1800 block of South Willow st. and when she observed 
Police she started walking towards 1814 S. Willow St. and up onto the porch.  The female stated that she lived there, and Officer 
Van Ness stated that she did not, which she then stated that her sister lived there, which she did not.  The female was later 
identified as Ms. Michelle Moore; her name was checked via NCIC and she did not have any active warrants etc.  Ms. Moore was 
allowed to leave and told not to come back to 2301 4th Ave.  Nothing further.

2010 W Polymer Dr18-052149 6/6/2018   8:00:00AM 91Z Damaged Property Accidental

On 06/06/2018 at 19:25 hours, Officer Hauge (79528) responded to a Damaged Property Accidental at 2010 W Polymer Dr. 
Police spoke with Mr. Belvin who stated he went into work this morning and when he came back out to his car at 1800 he noticed 
his diver side mirror was broken and hanging off the side of the car.

 
 

 
.

600 Tunnel Blvd18-052210 6/6/2018  10:28:00PM 91Z Field Interview

On 06/06/2018 at 22:29 hours, Officer Kaumer Hughes (0062192) reported a memo at 600 Tunnel Blvd.  Party was walking south 
on Tunnel at Shallowford Rd.  She said she was going to the Kanku's gas station at Brainerd and Germantown even though the 
Wilcox and Tunnel Kanku's was closer.  She does not have a history of prostitution, but was warned that her bravery to walk 
alone at night, and in an area known for street walkers, looks highly suspicious.   No warrants.  No further.

 
 

  
 

.

 
 



6/3/2018  12:00:51AM TO 6/9/2018  11:59:51PM

 

4408 Norcross Rd18-052224 6/6/2018  11:10:00PM 91Z Field Interview

On 06/06/2018 at 23:15 hours, Officer Veloz (75390) reported a memo at 4408 Norcross Rd.  A caller stated that the two were in 
a verbal disorder. Upon arrival to the scene I located the two individuals walking up norcross. I checked them for active 451's but 
neither had 451's. The two suspects identified as Johnathn Phillips and Porsha Presley. Both individuals stated that they were in 
a disagreement but that nothing was physical or problematic. Bot individuals were explained to keep their volume level a little 
lower and then released from detainment. Nothing further to report at this time.

1400 Sheridan Ave18-052230 6/6/2018  11:15:00PM 91Z Field Interview

On 06/06/2018 at 23:16 hours, Officer Day (467) conducted a traffic stop for a light law violation at 1400 Sheridan Ave. The 
driver of the vehicle was Jacob Wolfe, who is on probation for possession charges. Mr. Wolfe consented to a search of the 
vehicle and nothing was located. Mr. Wolfe was let off with a warning for the light violation. No further police action taken at this 
time.

 
 

 
 

.

 
 

2727 Rossville Blvd18-052245 6/6/2018  11:40:00PM 91Z Field Interview

On 06/06/2018 at 23:40 hours, I, Officer Bulkley (68389) observed an intoxicated party (Dawn Nation) laying on the ground at 
2700 Rossville Blvd.  Upon approaching the subject, she got up and crossed the street to the Mapco at 2727 Rossville Blvd.  
Dawn admitted to having drunk too much and asked for assistance getting to 2803 Faxon St.  Upon arriving we spoke with her 
aunt who said that the subject could stay at that location.  No further police action was required at this time.

 
 

 



6/3/2018  12:00:51AM TO 6/9/2018  11:59:51PM

200 Tremont St18-052261 6/7/2018  12:40:00AM 91Z Field Interview

On 06/07/2018 at 00:40 hours, Officer Josiah Blakney (78365) reported a memo at 200 Tremont St.  I stopped Mr. Justin Shaver 
for making a left turn through a red light on his black bicycle.  He also did not have any lights or reflectors on his bike.  No further.

1933 Hamill Rd18-052263 6/7/2018  12:30:00AM 91Z Field Interview

On 6-7-18 around 0030 hours I Ofc. Allison #237 made contact at 1933 Hamil Rd in the Mapco parking lot with a suspicious 
female. I had observed the female later identified as Cettina Gage in a red Toyota Solara TN  move the vehicle 
multiple times in the parking lot. Ms. Gage finally parked her car for the night on the property as her boyfriend came to pick her 
up. I explained to Ms. Gage she was acting very suspicious and had multiple light violations on her vehicle. Ms. Gage had a valid 
drivers license and no active warrants. Ms. Gage left the property with her boyfriend.

811 Palmetto St18-052317 6/7/2018   8:08:00AM 91Z Field Interview

On 06/07/2018 at 08:10 hours, Officer D. Russell (63833) conducted a field interview at 811  Palmetto St. Upon first approach, 
Police met with Bernard Glover who was sleeping outside the building under the awning. Mr. Glover stated he did not know he 
could not be there. Police checked Mr. Glover for any active warrants which came back negative. Police informed Mr. Glover 
that he needed to leave the premises and not return or he would be issued a citation for loitering. No further.

3121 E 45th St18-052319 6/7/2018   8:00:00AM 290 Vandalism

On 06/07/2018 at 09:10 hours, Officer Coleman (79519) responded to a Vandalism at 3121  E 45th St. Police made contact with 
Valery Web who state that her car window was busted out. Ms. Valery was unable to give suspect info. Nothing further to report.

616 Gillespie Rd18-052334 6/7/2018   9:25:00AM 91Z Miscellaneous Information

On 06/07/2018 at 09:25 hours, Officer Lockhart (66490) reported a memo at 616 Gillespie Rd.  Upon arrival I spoke with Chartela 
Burell who informed she let a younger b/m (name unknown) stay at her house the past few nights, but the male and she were 
involved in a verbal dispute this morning and she wanted him to leave.  Mr. Burell further stated the male had left the residence 
prior to police arrival and she would call police back if he returned.

4509 Rossville Blvd18-052340 6/7/2018   9:30:00AM 91Z Property Found

On 06/07/2018 at 09:41  hours, Officer Coleman (79519) reported a memo at 4509 Rossville Blvd.  Anonymous person gave 
police a wallet that was found. Wallet was turned in to property. Nothing further to report

 



6/3/2018  12:00:51AM TO 6/9/2018  11:59:51PM

122 Hunt Ave18-052405 6/7/2018   1:22:00PM 91Z Damaged Property Accidental

On 06/07/2018 at 13:22 hours, Officer Lockhart (66490) responded to a Damaged Property Accidental at 122 Hunt Ave.  Upon 
arrival I spoke with David Cunningham who informed me he is contracted by Innotion Enterprises, INC and that the company is 
requesting a police report for damage done to the inside of the dwelling.  Mr. Cunningham pointed out multiple holes in the sheet 
rock and ceiling that was more than likely damaged during an inspection process, according to him.  Mr. Cunningham estimated 
the damage at roughly $500.

3640 Hixson Pike18-052406 6/3/2018   7:00:00PM 240 MVT/Passenger Vehicle

On 06/07/2018 at 12:30 hours, Officer B. Martin (62436) responded to a MVT/Passenger Vehicle at 3640 Hixson Pike. I spoke to 
Hamilton Byrd, at 3640 Hixson Pike, at a car clean-up shop, where the vehicle was located. Byrd told me that sometime after 
close of business on Sunday and opening on Monday, the vehicle was stolen. I spoke to the owner Donnie Bradley who provided 
me with the VIN for the vehicle which I entered into NCIC using NIC# V730346450. The two business beside the Auto Clean Up 
have video surveillance. It is not known at this time however, if the theft was captured. No further information was available.

3821 Hixson Pike18-052407 6/6/2018   6:00:00PM 23H Other Theft/Non-Specific

On 06/07/2018 at 13:24 hours, Officer Glenn, Clifton (60757) responded to a Other Theft/Non-Specific at 3821  Hixson Pike.  I 
spoke with Thomas Tripp via telephone.  He says that sometime after 1800 hours last evening, unknown parties stole two(2) 
flower planters from the front of the building.  He says one was a smaller stainless steel planter with flowers and the other was a 
larger plastic gray flower planter with flowers.

6220 Shallowford Rd18-052409 6/7/2018   1:00:00PM 91Z Vehicle Recovered Stolen Outside 

On 06/07/2018 at 13:45 hours, Officer McFarland (62203) responded to a Vehicle Recovered Stolen Outside of Chattanooga at 
6220 Shallowford Rd.  Police were dispatched to Denton's Wrecker Service located at 7740 Lee Hwy.  I spoke to Jack Hale of 
Denton's who stated his crew is contracted by the Courts at Waterford at 6220 Shallowford Rd to handle their private tows.  Mr. 
Hale discovered one of the vehicles, a 2015 Toyota Yaris, was stolen after they towed it to their lot.  Police observed the vehicle 
to be in Denton's possession.  NCIC was notified to have the Georgia agency where the vehicle was stolen from to remove the 
vehicle from NCIC.

This case will be a recovery other agency and will not be investigated by this department; the follow up will be conducted by the 
agency the vehicle was reported stolen to at the time of its theft.

2020 Gunbarrel Rd18-052429 6/4/2018   6:00:00PM 23G Theft of Vehicle Parts/Accessories

On 06/07/2018 at 14:32 hours, PIT McMahan (61444) responded to a Theft of Vehicle Parts/Accessories at 2020 Gunbarrel Rd at 
the Walmart. The victim said that she last saw the Temp License Plate on her vehicle (2009 Hyundai Azera, silver in color, 
VIN/KMHFC45FX9A345219, ) when she parked it there at about 6 pm on Monday. When she got back to the car 
about 30 min later, she discovered that the plate was gone.  The car was purchased from: Highland Auto Sales,  814 N Main St,  
Lafayette, Ga. This report was taken by phone. Nic# P196542263.

1417 E 49th St18-052432 6/7/2018   2:50:00PM 91Z Miscellaneous Information

On 06/07/2018 at 15:00 hours, Officer Matthew Gerity (78344) reported a memo at 1417 E 49th St. Mrs. Castaneda, Jessica 
dropped off various personal items belonging to Mr. McDonal, Richard (in a black garbage bag) due to his incarceration. Mrs. 
Dorris (stepmom) accepted the bag of personal belongings as police maintained the peace. No further at this time.



6/3/2018  12:00:51AM TO 6/9/2018  11:59:51PM

 
 

 
 

 
 

 
.

1910 Market St18-052443 6/7/2018   2:00:00PM 91Z Miscellaneous Information

On 06/07/2018 at 15:00 hours, Officer Padlo (79534) reported a memo at 1910 Market St. Upon arrival, police spoke with the 
complainant, Shawn Dial. Mr. Dial is an employee of the Kankus on Market St. Mr. Dial stated there was a black male, wearing 
an orange shirt and bandanna, who was trespassed from the store. Police did not locate the black male.
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6/3/2018  12:00:51AM TO 6/9/2018  11:59:51PM

 

 
.

2111 Ivy St18-052502 6/7/2018   6:30:00PM 91Z Miscellaneous Information

On 06/07/2018 at 18:30 hours, Officer C.Lyle (682) responded to a disorder prevention at 2111  Ivy St. On the previous night Ms. 
Brenda Slater and Ms. Tiombre Slater got into an altercation that ended up with Ms. Tiombre Slater going to jail. Ms. Tiombre 
Slater came back to the house to get her belongings and Ms. Brenda did not was another altercation to occur. Ms. Tiombre got 
her items without incident and no disorder occurred. 
Nothing further to report.

5510 Highway 15318-052513 6/7/2018   6:30:00PM 91Z Vehicle Recovered Stolen Outside 

On 06/07/2018 at 18:30 hours, Sergeant Robert Bell #234 (0062177) responded to a Vehicle Recovered Stolen Outside of 
Chattanooga at 5510 Highway 153. While patrolling the parking lot, officer observed an orange Toyota Tacoma backed in to a 
parking space. The location of the space (rear of business) and the fact that this vehicle had sat on lot for at least two days led 
officer to believe this vehicle might have been stolen. A search of the  and VIN revealed the vehicle was stolen out 
of Hamilton County (HCSO #18-016587) on Memorial Day weekend 2018. The vehicle was removed from NCIC and the owner 
responded to recover his vehicle. No damage was noted by the owner. The keys were in the ignition of the vehicle. Nothing 
further.

This case will be a recovery other agency and will not be investigated by this department; the follow up will be conducted by the 
agency the vehicle was reported stolen to at the time of its theft.

 
 

                           

 
.



6/3/2018  12:00:51AM TO 6/9/2018  11:59:51PM

 
 

 

 
 

403 Roberts St18-052572 6/7/2018  11:17:00PM 91Z Miscellaneous Information

On 06/07/2018 at 23:20 hours, Officer J Sanchez (73514) responded to a disorder at 403 Roberts St. Upon arrival police spoke 
with the complainant, identified to be Lynnielle Mays ), who explained that she was in a verbal disorder with her 
mother, Melanie Calloway ( ), and her uncle Warren Mires ( ). Lynnielle stated that she had a "written 
contract" with her mother and her uncle regarding what she can and can not do in the house and what her mother and uncle can 
and cannot do. These items included curfew and certain friends allowed into the house. Lynnielle explained that her mother broke 
the agreement in some way and now Lynnielle wants to leave. Police explained that she was an adult and could do as she 
pleased. Lynnielle then called a taxi and gathered her belongings and went to a relatives house for the rest of the evening.
I also spoke with Melanie and Warren, and they corroborated Lynnielle's story, stating that they were in a verbal argument and 
Lynnielle wanted to leave. Both Melanie and Warren explained that they were trying to help Lynnielle make arrangements to 
leave but she stormed off and did not want to talk to them. Lynnielle left the area in a taxi. There is nothing further.

 
 

 

  
  
  

7707 Lee Hwy18-052607 6/8/2018   2:50:00AM 23D Theft from Building

On 06/08/2018 at 03:05 hours, Officer Justin Brumbaugh (0066622) responded to a Theft from Building at 7707 Lee Hwy. Ernest 
Robbins called police to report that someone had stolen his clothes and wallet from his room recently. He said that he was trying 
to help out a couple by letting them stay in his room overnight and thought that they were the ones who left with his things. They 
had previously been staying in room #133. I spoke to the front desk and was told that management would have to make the 
decision to give out the names of the people who were staying in that room. I left my contact information for management. No 
further action was necessary.



6/3/2018  12:00:51AM TO 6/9/2018  11:59:51PM

  

4600 Hwy 5818-052618 6/8/2018   4:00:00AM 91Z Field Interview

On 06/08/2018 at 04:10 hours, Officer Harvey, Charles (66485) reported a memo at 4600 Hwy 58. Police made contact with Mr. 
Hayes after receiving a call of a person possibly asleep in his vehicle.  Mr. Hayes stated he was a Lyft driver and was just resting 
and was going to get a cup of coffee before he went home.  Police ran Mr. Hayes thru NCIC for any active wants or warrants 
which came back negative.  Mr. Hayes was allowed to continue on his way with no further action taken at this time.  BWC was 
worn and activated during this call for service.

3739 Hixson Pike18-052639 6/8/2018  12:01:00AM 290 Vandalism

On 06/08/2018 at 07:40 hours, Officer B. Martin (62436) responded to a Vandalism at 3739 Hixson Pike. Upon arrival I spoke 
with office manager, Rhonda Edwards, regarding a case of vandalism. Edwards showed police where a rock had been thrown 
through a office window. No suspect information was available.

1606 Bush Rd18-052659 6/7/2018   4:30:00PM 23F Theft from Motor Vehicle

On 06/08/2018 at 08:42 hours, Officer Garcia (8003) responded to a Theft from Motor Vehicle at 1606 Bush Rd. I spoke to victim 
William Edmond via telephone and he stated that on 6/8/2018 at 6:45 am he noticed his black 2007 Chevy Silverado had been 
broken into. Rp last used his vehicle on 6/7/2018 at 4:30 pm. Rp then noticed his hand gun had been stolen ( see property ). No 
suspect information at this time. Nothing else stolen. No damage to the vehicle . Nothing further.   Nic# G304436511

6502 Bonny Oaks Dr18-052670 6/8/2018   9:20:00AM 23G Theft of Vehicle Parts/Accessories

On 06/08/2018 at 10:00 hours, PIT McMahan (61444) responded to a Theft of Vehicle Parts/Accessories at 6502 Bonny Oaks Dr 
at the Driver License Center. The victim said that she left her car (2011  Toyota Avalon, Tn ) parked in the lot 
there at about 9:20 am, and the license plate was still attached to the car at that time. When she got back out to the car just now, 
she discovered that the plate was gone. This report was taken by phone. Nic# P926530982.

5773 Brainerd Rd18-052692 6/8/2018  10:00:00AM 91Z Damaged Property Accidental

On 06/08/2018 at 11:01  hours, Officer Branam (70776) responded to a Damaged Property Accidental at 5773 Brainerd Rd.  On 
arrival, I spoke to a Mr. McArthur Sharp.  He stated that at an unknown time, and unknown location, his vehicle was damaged by 
an unknown source.  I observed large scratch and dents on the passenger side of his vehicle.  Mr. Sharp stated that he would like 
a property damage report for his insurance.

5706 Lee Hwy18-052700 6/8/2018  10:00:00AM 91Z Damaged Property Accidental

On 06/08/2018 at 11:30 hours, Officer Branam (70776) responded to a Damaged Property Accidental at 5706 Lee Hwy.   On 
arrival, I spoke to a Mr. Randy Bidwell.  He stated that at an unknown time, at and unknown location, his vehicle was damaged by 
an unknown source.  Mr. Bidwell stated he would like a property damage report for his insurance.



6/3/2018  12:00:51AM TO 6/9/2018  11:59:51PM

 

 
 
 

 
.

 
 

1508 E 28th St18-052722 6/8/2018  12:42:00PM 91Z Field Interview

On 06/08/2018 at 12:43 hours, Officer Matthew Gerity (78344) reported a memo at 1508 E 28th St. Mrs. Devries was walking in 
the area of an activated alarm from business. It appeared that the business was not harmed in anyway but surrounded by barbed 
wire. This field interview was to merely state that Mrs. Devries was at this location if anything were to arise later on this week. No 
further

806 S Watkins St18-052727 6/8/2018  12:40:00PM 91Z Miscellaneous Information

On 06/08/2018 at 13:05 hours, Officer Hicks (68400) responded to a verbal disorder at 806 S Watkins St. Upon arrival police 
spoke to Natasha Hyter B/F , who stated that her son,  Tyron Suttles B/M  would not listen or obey 
her. Police spoke to both parties about the issue and they resolved the matter with an apology.

 

3604 Tennessee Ave18-052767 6/3/2018  12:00:00PM 26B Credit Card/ATM Fraud

On 06/08/2018 at 14:48 hours, PIT McMahan (61444) responded to a Credit Card/ATM Fraud at 3604 Tennessee Ave at First Tn 
Bank. The victim said that he received a notice on his phone from Walmart that his pre-paid debit card account had an illegal 
charge on it for $263.00 total. He said that he found out that the charge was done at First Tn at an ATM and apparently someone 
had used a fake card there with his card's number on it. I notified Inv Petty of this incident by email. This report was taken by 
phone.



6/3/2018  12:00:51AM TO 6/9/2018  11:59:51PM

 
 

 
 

 
 
 

 

 

 

 
 

 

5914 Highway 5818-052782 6/4/2018  11:00:00AM 26B Credit Card/ATM Fraud

On 06/08/2018 at 15:27 hours, PIT McMahan (61444) responded to a Credit Card/ATM Fraud at 5914 Highway 58 at First Tn 
Bank. The victim said that his debit card number was skimmed and used on a fake card, which was used to make an illegal 
withdrawal from an ATM at First Tn on 6/4/18 for a $503 charge. He discovered the charge on his bank statement at about 11  am 
that day but he does not know the time of the transaction. He said that the bank gave him no other information. I notified Inv 
Petty of this incident by email. This report was taken by phone.

 
 

 

 
 

 



6/3/2018  12:00:51AM TO 6/9/2018  11:59:51PM

5606 Brainerd Rd18-052826 6/8/2018   4:50:00PM 240 MVT/Passenger Vehicle

On 06/08/2018 at 17:05 hours, Officer Joshua Blaine Price (76315) responded to a MVT/Passenger Vehicle at 5606 Brainerd Rd. 
Upon arrival I was met by Lebron Rakestraw. Mr Rakestraw stated that he had parked his car in the parking lot of AppleBees and 
went inside to use the restroom. When he returned outside his car was gone. Mr Rakestraw did say he left the keys in the car. No 
video is available of the parking lot. The car has nothing on it to make the car stand out. Mr Rakestraw said the car has a flat 
screen CD player in it and misc hand tools.
Vehicle was BOLO and entered into NCIC.
Nothing further at this time.

This case was reviewed and will not have any suspect leads at this time; the victim was contacted and did not have any new 
information in the case. Based on the lack of leads the case will be suspended, if any leads are later developed the case will then 
be assigned to an investigator for follow up.

400 Workman Rd18-052833 6/8/2018   5:00:00PM 91Z Vehicle Recovered Stolen Outside 

This case will be a recovery other agency and will not be investigated by this department; the follow up will be conducted by the 
agency the vehicle was reported stolen to at the time of its theft.

2324 Harrison Pike18-052836 6/8/2018   3:45:00PM 91Z All Other Traffic Offenses

On 06/08/2018 at 15:50 hours, Officer Bryan Asbury (78352) responded to a crash at 2324 Harrison Pike. Upon arrival police 
located a black Toyota 4Runner and a white Ford F-150 in the southbound lane. The 4Runner was facing east towards the ditch 
and the F-150 was facing west with his driver’s side rear of his vehicle against Bell South Pole N3 040T, police did not observe 
any damage to the pole. The driver of vehicle 2, Philip Unger told police that he was traveling North on Harrison Pike when he 
saw the black SUV heading south swerve left out of lane taking out the mailbox at 2324 Harrison Pike and then swerving back 
down the hill in to the passenger side of his F-150. Mr. Unger stated that he then got spun in to the utility pole mentioned above. 
Police then spoke with the driver of vehicle 1, Colin Shannon. Mr. Shannon told police that his steering began acting funny while 
he was traveling South on Harrison Pike so he tried to pull over to the left of the road and when he swerved to avoid one vehicle 
he made contact with the F-150. Neither driver reported any injuries while on scene. Vehicle 1 was privately towed, vehicle 2 was 
towed via Reliable Towing to their lot. The driver of vehicle 1 Colin Shannon was arrested for driving on revoked, no insurance, 
registration violation and due care. Nothing further at this time.

1606 W 43rd St18-052841 6/8/2018   6:07:00PM 91Z Miscellaneous Information

On 06/08/2018 at 18:07 hours, Officer Mike Taylor (60892) reported a memo at 1606 W 43rd St. I (Sgt Taylor #389) responded to 
this location to check the well being of the resident who was reported to be bipolar and off her medication. Upon arrival, I located 
no one at the home and could not get anyone to the door. There was no sign of forced entry or of anything to suggest anyone 
was in distress. No other action could yet be taken by police.

301 N Holtzclaw Ave18-052867 6/8/2018   6:57:00PM 23F Theft from Motor Vehicle

On 06/11/2018 at 11:38 hours, Officer Glenn, Clifton (60757) wrote a continuation/supplement for a Theft from Motor Vehicle at 
301  N Holtzclaw Ave.  I spoke with Kristy Hopkins via telephone.  She says there were numerous items that she was unaware of 
being stolen when she spoke with the officer.  She listed those items.

400 Highway 153 Sb18-052877 6/8/2018   8:09:00PM 91Z Damaged Property Accidental



6/3/2018  12:00:51AM TO 6/9/2018  11:59:51PM

On 06/08/2018 at 20:13 hours, Officer Shelor, Nicholas (78349) responded to a Damaged Property Accidental at 400 Highway 
153 Sb. Upon arrival, I spoke with Mr. Bruce Stansell; he stated that he was travelling South on Hwy 153 and a piece of 
plexiglass fell off of another vehicle and hit his windshield. As the piece of plexiglass hit his windshield it shattered his windshield 
and then broke the glass on his driver side mirror. Mr. Stansell stated that he saw a dark Suv that appeared to have a flat tire 
hauling plexiglass on the top of the vehicle and he decided to get out of the lane behind him and as he did the piece of plexiglass 
came off of the Suv and hit his windshield. The Suv did not notice that the plexiglass fell from their vehicle and kept driving south 
on Hwy 153. Mr. Stansell then stopped and awaited for police. After police arrived Mr. Stansell drove his vehicle to a nearby 
friend’s house to park it and then got a ride to his residence in GA. No further.

 

                                    

3767 Occonechee Trl18-052926 6/8/2018  10:00:00PM 91Z Miscellaneous Information

On 06/08/2018 at 22:02 hours, Officer Winkelman (75392) responded to a disorder at 3767 Occonechee Trl. Upon arrival police 
spoke with the complainant, Wendy Leffew, who stated Thomas Taylor was staying with her for a while because him and his wife 
were split up. Ms. Leffew stated Mr. Thomas was cussing and and arguing with her over moving his stuff from his other house to 
her house. Ms. Leffew did not want him there for the night because she had several kids there and didnt want them arounfd his 
attitude. Mr. Thomas agreed to leave for the night. No further police action taken.

3220 Wilcox Blvd18-052940 6/8/2018  10:35:00PM 91Z Field Interview

On 06/08/2018 at 22:35 hours, Officer Kaumer Hughes (0062192) reported a memo at 3220 Wilcox Blvd.  Mr. Joseph Durrah and 
his friend was sitting in front of his business, Bro's Grocery, and explained how it is a Tobacco Mart.  he said he usually close at 
10 pm but that business has been picking up, being its the first of the month and all.  His friend kindly offered me a bottled water, 
which I had to decline.  Mr. Durrah has been there for two years, and said their hasn't been any trouble from the businesses in the 
building.  No further.

 
 



6/3/2018  12:00:51AM TO 6/9/2018  11:59:51PM

 

  

3001 Kings Point Rd18-053016 6/9/2018   1:50:00AM 91Z Field Interview

On 06/09/2018 at 01:55 hours, Officer Justin Brumbaugh (0066622) reported a memo at 3001  Kings Point Rd. While patrolling 
the park after dark during closed hours I located Thomas Eckert sitting in his vehicle. He stated that he had no real reason for 
being in the park and claimed he didn't know it was closed after dark. I informed him that he is not to be back at the swimming 
area or up on the hill after dark in the future.

2017 E 23rd St18-053028 6/9/2018   2:30:00AM 91Z Miscellaneous Information

On 06/09/2018 at 02:38 hours, Officer J. Crawford (79520) reported a memo at 2017 E 23rd St.  On the above time and date, 
Police recived a call of suspicious activity at the above address.  Upon arrival Police spoke with Mr. Leroy Legates and Mr. 
Steven Conterio who are truck drivers parked overnight at the above location.  Both men stated they were sleeping at 
approximately 0230 hours, in the cabs of their trucks when an unknown individual(s) began "beating on the windows" of their 
trucks.  Both men stated the they were awakened by noises but did not look to see who was outside.  Both men stated the beating 
on the windows ended shortly before Police arrived.  The men did not have suspect information or a direction of travel and Police 
did not observe damage to the vehicles while on scene.  Police did not locate any suspicious parties in the area.

2415 Oak St18-053038 6/9/2018   3:25:00AM 91Z Miscellaneous Information

On 06/09/2018 at 03:35 hours, Officer Nelson (66968) responded to a disorder at 2415 Oak St. Upon arrival I spoke to Ms. 
Tillision who stated the party she was in a disorder with had already left the scene.  I attempted to gather the other party who was 
involved in the disorders information.  Ms. Tillison was very uncooperative and refused to give any other information.
No further police action required at this time.

2245 Hickory Valley Rd18-053040 6/9/2018   3:00:00AM 240 MVT/Passenger Vehicle

This case was reviewed and will not have any suspect leads at this time; the victim was contacted and did not have any new 
information in the case. Based on the lack of leads the case will be suspended, if any leads are later developed the case will then 
be assigned to an investigator for follow up.

1705 Verona Dr18-053064 6/9/2018  12:00:00AM 23F Theft from Motor Vehicle

On 06/09/2018 at 07:15 hours, Officer McFarland (62203) responded to a Theft from Motor Vehicle at 1705 Verona Dr.  Upon 
arrival, I spoke to the victim, Brian Sylvester, who stated that sometime during the night an unknown suspect(s) went through two 
of his vehicles which were parked in the driveway.  Mr. Sylvester stated the suspect(s) took two Garmin GPS devices worth 
approximately $300 total.  There were no signs of forced entry to the vehicles and nothing was damaged.  There was nothing to 
process on the scene and there is no suspect information or leads at the time of the report.



6/3/2018  12:00:51AM TO 6/9/2018  11:59:51PM

2308 Green Forest Ln18-053070 6/8/2018   8:00:00PM 23F Theft from Motor Vehicle

On 06/09/2018 at 07:45 hours, Officer Branam (70776) responded to a Theft from Motor Vehicle at 2308 Green Forest Ln.  On 
arrival, I spoke to a Ms. Melisa Locklin.  She stated that while she was at work last night, an unknown suspect took the 
registration off a vehicle she had at her home .  There were no witnesses to this incident and no apparent evidence 
to process at this time.  NCIC was notified and the vehicle's tag was entered as stolen under NIC#P066548354.

3100 N Chamberlain Ave18-053087 6/9/2018   8:00:00AM 91Z Miscellaneous Information

On 06/09/2018 at 08:21  hours, Officer Downs (68391) reported a memo at 3100 N Chamberlain Ave. 
Police spoke with the complainant, Amanda King, who stated that she wanted her boyfriend gone from the house and wanted her 
house put on the watch list.

Clarence Smith was already gone from the residence when Police arrived on scene. Smith came back on scene and stated he 
needed to get to his job in Alton Park. I gave Smith a ride to Alton Park and 38th Street at the car wash.

314 Mcbrien Rd18-053114 6/8/2018   7:00:00PM 23G Theft of Vehicle Parts/Accessories

On 06/09/2018 at 10:30 hours, Officer Lockhart (66490) responded to a Theft of Vehicle Parts/Accessories at 314 Mcbrien Rd.  
Upon arrival I spoke with Mr. Daniel Ferro who informed me his license plate, , was stolen from his 1994 Honda CB 
250 motorcycle.  Mr. Ferro stated the plate was stolen sometime between 6/8/2018 at 1900 hours to the time of this report.  Mr. 
Ferro had no suspect information at this time. The plate was entered into NCIC under NIC#P746578308.

7273 Aventine Way18-053116 6/6/2018   8:00:00AM 26A False Pretenses/Swindle/Confidenc

On 06/09/2018 at 10:40 hours, Officer McFarland (62203) responded to a False Pretenses/Swindle/Confidence Game at 7273 
Aventine Way.  Upon arrival I spoke to victim, Tim Camarela, who stated he sold his Sony PS4 online.  Mr. Camarela stated he 
believed to be selling his PS4 to a person in Texas and shipped it overnite to "150 Avandale Ave, Azel. TX" prior to receiving 
funds.  Police attempted to verify the address but was unsuccessful in finding it.  Mr. Camarela stated he sold his PS4 to an 
unknown individual for $350 and believed he would receive payment for it but never did.  When he attempted to contact the 
suspect, he received a vulgar message from someone stating they lived in Mexico.  He also stated the transaction was going to 
be through PayPal but he never received funds.  Mr. Camarela stated he spoke to UPS who verified the address and that the 
package was delivered to a female party.  Police referred Mr. Camarela to our Fraud Division for further.

3158 Broad St18-053171 6/9/2018   1:44:00PM 91Z Field Interview

On 06/09/2018 at 13:46 hours, Officer P. McCall (0066492) responded to the Dollar General at 3158 Broad St. The employees of 
Dollar General had previously caught Mr. Robert Allen shoplifting in the store and banned him from the property. They told police 
he is not allowed back and that they would prosecute for criminal trespassing if he returned. Mr. Allen was made aware of the 
situation and said he would not be back on the property.

4311 13th Ave18-053182 6/9/2018   2:30:00PM 91Z Miscellaneous Information

On 06/09/2018 at 14:35 hours, Officer J. Billingsley (79518) responded to see a complainant at 4311 13th Ave. Upon arrival, I 
spoke with the complainant, Travis Bray. Mr. Bray informed me that his ex girlfriend, Yasmine Huggins, told him she was going to 
make a false police report in Rossville, Georgia. Mr. Bray told me Ms. Huggins wanted to make a report about him hitting her, 
which he stated, did not happen. Ms. Huggins was not on scene upon police arrival. Mr. Bray told me he wanted a report 
documenting such information. No further at this time.



6/3/2018  12:00:51AM TO 6/9/2018  11:59:51PM

 

 
 

350 Carnation St18-053266 6/9/2018   5:00:00AM 91Z Damaged Property Accidental

On 06/09/2018 at 19:20 hours, Officer T. Durham (77571) responded to a Damaged Property Accidental at 350 Carnation St. 
Upon arrival I spoke with Mr. Sidney Cloud. Mr Cloud stated at 5 in the morning he heard a noise that woke him up, he then 
looked outside but seeing nothing he went back to sleep. He later found his wheel barrel damaged in the roadway and suspected 
it to be his neighbors at 358 Carnation but had no proof. I then went and spoke to a resident at that address who stated everyone 
at that address leaves at 8 in the morning, and they knew nothing about the damaged wheel barrel. Nothing Further.

607 Cherokee Blvd18-053276 6/9/2018   7:32:00PM 91Z Suspicious Activity

On 06/09/2018 at 19:40 hours, Officer Corbin (78368) reported a memo at 607 Cherokee Blvd. Police received a call from 
Claudia Tedesco. She was extremely intoxicated and could not clearly explain to dispatch what she needed. Police arrived on 
scene and foud Ms. Tedesco. She was extremely intoxicated but her boyfriend was on scene and offered to take her home 
immediately. Ms. Tedesco was given a ride hom and told not to come back to 607 Cherokee Blvd.(Ziggys bar and grill). Ms. 
Tedesco was claiming to have lost her phone but she was too intoxicated to make a report.

7800 Igou Gap Rd18-053284 6/9/2018   7:55:00PM 91Z Miscellaneous Information

On 06/09/2018 at 20:30 hours, Officer Springer (66500) reported a memo at 7800 Igou Gap Rd. Upon arrival police spoke with 
Julian Trotter. He stated his vehicle would not steer and the brakes were not working very well. He decided to leave his white 
2002 Cadillac sedan ) parked on the side of the road. He said he would call a tow later. Police gave him a ride to his 
residence. Nothing further.

5546 Hwy 15318-053289 6/9/2018   8:11:00PM 91Z Miscellaneous Information

On 06/09/2018 at 20:15 hours, I, MPO Ric Engle (60825) responded to a disorder at 5546 Hwy 153.   Upon arrival, I spoke to the 
complainant, Carson Lake.

The complainant told me he was going NB on Hwy 153 when a tan GMC pick up (unknown tag) got behind him and the white 
male driver started to yell at him to get out of the way.  The complainant drove into the Fire House Subs lot and the other vehicle 
turned off.  The complainant had a video of the end of the encounter, but did not get enough information to do a follow up.  No 
other police action taken.

 
 

 



6/3/2018  12:00:51AM TO 6/9/2018  11:59:51PM

4829 Brainerd Rd18-053298 6/9/2018   8:32:00PM 91Z Field Interview

On 06/09/2018 at 20:32 hours, Officer Harrison (73500) responded to a suspicious person call at 4829 Brainerd Rd. Upon arrival I 
spoke with Mr. Daniel Henderson, who stated that he had been working on a person's car at the McDonalds parking lot and the 
person just left and he had no ride. Mr. Henderson said he was waiting for the bus to take him home. He was checked for 
warrants and released without further incident.

601 Tunnel Blvd18-053300 6/9/2018   8:29:00PM 91Z Miscellaneous Information

On 06/09/2018 at 20:29 hours, Officer Harrison (73500) reported a memo at 601  Tunnel Blvd. I spoke with Shamieka Hart who 
was in some sort of disorder/ accident somewhere on Shallowford Rd. Ms. Hart does not have a license or insurance on her 
vehicle and declined a wreck report. She stated that concluding the disorder the other vehicle drove away. No further action.

5764 Hwy 15318-053302 6/9/2018   8:48:00PM 91Z Miscellaneous Information

On 06/09/2018 at 20:50 hours, I, MPO Ric Engle (60825) responded to a miscellaneous call at 5764 Hwy 153.   Upon arrival, I 
spoke to the complainant, Patrick Hitchcock.

The complainant told me he tried to cash his check at Walmart and his social security number came up with another name, 
Reana Weekley.  When the complainant found out it was his wife using his SSN, he stated he did not need police anymore and 
would handle the situation without law enforcement involvement.  No other police action taken.

 

 

 
 

 

3777 Wilcox Blvd18-053431 6/8/2018   3:00:00AM 91Z Miscellaneous Information

On 06/10/2018 at 03:01  hours, Officer Kaumer Hughes (0062192) reported a Broken Down Vehicle/Tow at 3777 Wilcox Blvd.  
Police/I observed the white a 2002 Chevy Impala had been broken down at this location for two days.   It has no tag (VIN # 
2G1WH55K829327032), and faced westward.  Vehicle's VIN # doesn't show as registered to anyone, and doesn't show up in 
Coplink to find anyone connected to it.  It is clearly abandoned, as the rear driver's side window has been recently punctured; and 
while the window still stands, it remains shattered, as if someone poked clean through it with a pole.  Les's Wrecker towed it.  No 
further.

2612 Hickory Valley Rd18-053506 6/9/2018  10:00:00PM 23F Theft from Motor Vehicle



6/3/2018  12:00:51AM TO 6/9/2018  11:59:51PM

On 06/10/2018 at 10:18 hours, Officer Glenn, Clifton (60757) responded to a Theft from Motor Vehicle at 2612 Hickory Valley Rd.   
I spoke with Dale Smith via telephone.  He says sometime after 2200 hours last night, an unknown party entered his 2017 Toyota 
Tacoma and stole his Beretta 380 semi-automatic pistol. He says it was loaded with 6 rounds.   He says he will not have the serial 
number until tomorrow when the store opens where he purchased it.

5428 Hwy 15318-053869 6/9/2018   7:52:00PM 26B Credit Card/ATM Fraud

On 06/11/2018 at 08:52 hours, Officer Glenn, Clifton (60757) responded to a Credit Card/ATM Fraud at 5428 Hwy 153.  I spoke 
with Edwin Freeman via telephone.  He says that on 09 June, 2018 at 1952 hours, an unknown party used his CitiBank Master 
Card information to make a purchase at Lowe's in the amount of $1,843.92.  Mr. Freeman says that he is in possession of his 
credit card and has no idea how his card information was stolen.

1330 E 3rd St18-053872 6/8/2018   5:56:00PM 26B Credit Card/ATM Fraud

On 06/11/2018 at 09:07 hours, Officer Glenn, Clifton (60757) responded to a Credit Card/ATM Fraud at 1330 E 3rd St.  I spoke 
with Kristy Hopkins via telephone.  She says that she reported a vehicle break in C # 18-052867 at 301  N. Holtzclaw.  She says 
as a result. the unknown used her N. Carolina State Employee Credit Union debit card to make a purchase of $49.15 at the 
Speedway which was across the street from where her vehicle was broken into.  She says she has since canceled the card.

3922 Volunteer Dr18-053888 6/8/2018   7:00:00PM 290 Vandalism

On 06/11/2018 at 10:10 hours, Officer William Bernitt (77564) responded to a Vandalism at 3922 Volunteer Dr.  Upon arrival 
police spoke with Daniel Painter who stated a company vehicle had been damaged.  Mr. Painter stated the vehicle had damage 
to the front driver side window.  It appeared as though someone tried to break the window out but the unknown suspect was 
unsuccessful.  No other damage was noted to the vehicle.  No suspect information is known at this time.  Mr. Painter stated there 
are no cameras in the vicinity of the vehicle.  Nothing further.

100 Riverfront Pkwy18-053962 6/8/2018  10:00:00PM 91Z Property Lost

On 06/11/2018 at 13:00 hours, Officer Glenn, Clifton (60757) responded to a Property Lost at 100 Riverfront Pkwy.  I spoke with 
Robert Lee via telephone.  He says that at or about 2200 hours Friday night, he purchased tokens for River Bend.  He says 
somehow he lost his wallet at that time.  He says that it also had a Capital One credit card and a USAA debit card.  He says that 
the Capital One card was used out of town.  He is clear that he needs to make a report where the card was used.




